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Romans 13:1 Let everyone be subject to the governing authorities, for there is no 
authority except that which God has established. The authorities that exist have 
been established by God. 2 Consequently, whoever rebels against the authority is 
rebelling against what God has instituted, and those who do so will bring judgment 
on themselves. 3 For rulers hold no terror for those who do right, but for those who 
do wrong. Do you want to be free from fear of the one in authority? Then do what is 
right and you will be commended. 4 For the one in authority is God’s servant for your 
good. But if you do wrong, be afraid, for rulers do not bear the sword for no reason. 
They are God’s servants, agents of wrath to bring punishment on the wrongdoer. 5 
Therefore, it is necessary to submit to the authorities, not only because of possible 
punishment but also as a matter of conscience.   
   
 
 
 
   
 
Isaiah 41:10 Fear not, for I am with you; be not dismayed, for I am your God; I will 
strengthen you, I will help you, I will uphold you with my righteous right hand. 
 
Daniel 10:19a And he said, “O man greatly loved, fear not, peace be with you; be 
strong and of good courage.” … 
 
Joshua 1:9 Have I not commanded you? Be strong and courageous. Do not be 
frightened, and do not be dismayed, for the Lord your God is with you wherever you 
go. 
   
 
 
 
   
 
 
Four Christian Responses to Terrorism: 
 
A. ______________________________________ 
   
 
Isaiah 14:24 The Lord of hosts has sworn: “As I have planned, so shall it be, and as I 
have purposed, so shall it stand.” 
 

2 Peter 3:8 But do not overlook this one fact, beloved, that with the Lord one day is 
as a thousand years, and a thousand years as one day. 9 The Lord is not slow to 
fulfill his promise as some count slowness, but is patient toward you, not wishing that 
any should perish, but that all should reach repentance.  10 But the day of the Lord 
will come like a thief, and then the heavens will pass away with a roar, and the 
heavenly bodies will be burned up and dissolved, and the earth and the works that 
are done on it will be exposed. 
 
Romans 12:19 Beloved, never avenge yourselves, but leave it to the wrath of God, 
for it is written, “Vengeance is mine, I will repay, says the Lord.” 
  
 
 
 
   
 
Matthew 5: 43 “You have heard that it was said, ‘You shall love your neighbor and 
hate your enemy.’ 44 But I say to you, Love your enemies and pray for those who 
persecute you,  45 so that you may be sons of your Father who is in heaven. For he 
makes his sun rise on the evil and on the good, and sends rain on the just and on 
the unjust. 
 
B. ______________________________________ 
 
C. ______________________________________ 
 
  
 
 
 
   
 
Matthew 29:19 Go therefore and make disciples of all nations, baptizing them in the 
name of the Father and of the Son and of the Holy Spirit, 20 teaching them to 
observe all that I have commanded you. And behold, I am with you always, to the 
end of the age.” 
 
D. ______________________________________ 
 
 
 
“Courage is being scared to death… and saddling up anyway.” – John Wayne 
 
“Whatever a person may be like, we must still love them because we love God.” 
 – John Calvin  
 


